

Line #	Brand	Instrument or Accessory	Estimated Quantity	Adorama	Alamo Music	Boomer Music	K&S Music	Music & Arts	Romeo Music	Washington Music	West Music	Nick Rail Music
1	Basic Beat	Rubber Tip Mallet, medium, BBRM	40 each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.69/pair	No Bid
2	Basic Beat	Yarn Tip Mallet, medium, BBYM	20 each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.30/pair	No Bid
3	American Drum	Glockenspiel mallets, small, hard rubber tip, P41	8 pairs	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.96/pair	No Bid
4	Studio 49	Alto Glockenspiel, small, metal bars, series 2000 AGd	3 each	No Bid	\$201.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$210.35	No Bid	\$200.00	\$205.91	No Bid
5	Studio 49	Soprano Glockenspiel, smallest, metal bars, series 2000 SGd	3 each	No Bid	\$189.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$197.98	No Bid	\$188.00	\$193.80	No Bid
6	Studio 49	Soprano Xylophone, small, wood bars, series 2000 SX 2000	4 each	No Bid	\$542.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$570.06	No Bid	\$535.00	\$553.14	No Bid
7	Studio 49	Soprano Metallophone, small, metal bars, series 2000 SM 2000	2 each	No Bid	\$578.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$607.51	No Bid	\$570.00	\$589.48	No Bid
8	Studio 49	Alto Xylophone, medium, wood bars, series 2000 AX 2000	6 each	No Bid	\$756.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$774.23	No Bid	\$746.00	\$771.16	No Bid
9	Studio 49	Alto Metallophone, medium, metal bars, series 2000 AM 2000	2 each	No Bid	\$768.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$807.23	No Bid	\$758.00	\$783.28	No Bid
10	Studio 49	Bass Xylophone, large, wood bars, series 2000 BX 2000	3 each	No Bid	\$1,680.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,748.79	No Bid	\$1,655.00	\$1,711.90	No Bid
11	Studio 49	Bass Metallophone, large, metal bars, series 2000 BM 2000	2 each	No Bid	\$1,625.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,691.05	No Bid	\$1,601.00	\$1,655.38	No Bid
12	Remo	World music drumming drum pack, 14 tubanos with auxiliary percussion, PP-WMD C-EE	1 pack	No Bid	\$2,921.18	\$3,575.00	No Bid	\$2,567.02	\$3,416.65	No Bid	\$2,744.69 Set has 13 tubanos	No Bid
13	Drum Alive	Drums alive class set, stability balls and accessories, 205171	1 set	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,586.30	No Bid
14	Malmark	Hand chimes, silver/black with case, 204363, 25 chimes/pack	2 packs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,350.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,211.25	No Bid
15	Malmark	Hand chime add-on set, silver/black with case, 204369, 12 chimes/pack	1 pack	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$812.25	No Bid
16	Boomwhackers	Boomwhackers diatonic set, plastic rainbow pipes, 8/pack	4 packs	No Bid	\$30.00	\$14.50 BWDG	No Bid	\$18.95	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.60	No Bid
17	Boomwhackers	Boomwhackers, chromatic add-ons, plastic rainbow pipes, 5/pack	2 packs	No Bid	\$18.18	\$10.50 BWCG	No Bid	\$13.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.43	No Bid
18	Boomwhackers	Boomwhackers, octavators, black plastic endcaps, 8/pack	2 packs	No Bid	\$8.78	\$5.75	No Bid	\$7.42	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.41	No Bid
19	Cordoba	Ukuleles, mahogany, satin finish, 15CM concert	30 each	Substitute - \$62.45	\$67.56	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.70	No Bid	\$71.00	\$84.55	No Bid
20	Yamaha	3/4 size acoustic guitar, spruce top, mahogany sides, JR1 or JR1 FG	30 each	Sub - \$85.88	\$98.76 JR1	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.50 JR1	No Bid	\$111.00 JR1	\$121.12 JR1	No Bid
21	Alesis	Keyboard, concert 88 key, CONCERTXUS	15 each	\$164.01	\$234.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$214.95	\$219.00	\$234.00	\$259.00	No Bid
22	Chomacast	Keyboard stand, double brace, x-style, CC-KSTAND	15 each	\$19.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Fender	Electric guitar package, Squier, Stratocaster, case and amp, 037182300	4 sets	\$153.23	\$148.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$144.26	No Bid	\$175.00	\$177.64 Model 0371823006	No Bid
24	Ibanez	Electric bass guitar, black, miKro series, GSRM20	4 each	\$127.39	\$187.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$131.91	No Bid	\$145.00	\$145.33	No Bid
25	Ibanez	Bass gig bags, black, soft case, IBBMIKRO	4 each	\$19.82	\$37.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.89	No Bid	\$24.00	No Bid	No Bid
26	Ampeg	Bass amps, 20W amp, BA108V2	4 each	Sub - \$104.60	\$135.99	No Bid	No Bid	\$71.99	Sub - \$125.00	Sub - \$205.00	No Bid	No Bid
27	Electro-Voice	Portable PA system, 8-channel, sub and tower, 3-piece set, Evolve 50	2 sets	\$926.52	\$1,293.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,071.84	\$1,202.32	\$1,474.00	No Bid	No Bid
28	Electro-Voice	PA wheeled carrying case, black, rolling, Evolve 50 Case	2 each	\$199.00	\$165.61	No Bid	No Bid	\$369.35	\$159.27	\$165.00	No Bid	No Bid
29	Not specified	CAT 6 RJ45 Network Cable, 30-foot, RJ45 connector	1 each	\$73.24	\$33.18 *Duracat-30	\$12.50 Belkin	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$29.95	No Bid	No Bid
30	Shure	Microphones, Shure SM58	6 each	\$76.96	\$95.00	\$87.00	No Bid	\$74.33	\$96.00	\$85.75	No Bid	No Bid
31	Rockville	Microphone stands, quick-release boom stands, RVMIC3	6 each	\$57.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32	Rode	Choir mics, 1/2 inch condenser mics, M5 compact	1 paired set	\$137.45	\$214.99	No Bid	No Bid	\$137.94	\$171.60	\$165.00	No Bid	No Bid
33	Rapco horizon	XLR cables, 30-foot, N1M1-30	10 each	\$15.19	\$18.97	\$27.75	No Bid	\$11.95	No Bid	\$18.95	No Bid	No Bid
34	Pro Co	1/4 inch cables, 20-foot, EG-20	15 each	\$8.36	\$11.48	\$7.45	No Bid	\$7.77	No Bid	\$10.49	No Bid	No Bid
35	Alesis	Electric drum kit, 3 cymbals, 5 mesh drums, 2 pedals, Command, COMMANDMESHKITXUS	1 set	\$563.80	\$765.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$581.45	\$660.00	\$687.00	\$604.82	No Bid
36	Simmons	Drum amp, 25W, DA25	1 each	\$247.77	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$101.00	Sub - \$192	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
37	Hercules	Guitar racks, holds 5 guitars, GS525B	8 each	\$47.84	\$69.00	No Bid	\$120.00	\$59.45	No Bid	\$69.95	No Bid	No Bid
38	M-Audio	MIDI keyboard, M-Audio, Hammer 88	1 each	\$385.37	\$453.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$299.40	Substitute - \$172.80	\$447.00	No Bid	No Bid
39	M-Audio	Keyboard sustain pedal, M-Audio, SP2	1 each	\$19.82	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.75	No Bid	No Bid
40	On-Stage	Keyboard stand, folding Z-stand, KS7350	1 each	\$64.22	\$55.99	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.75	No Bid	\$109.00	\$100.90	No Bid
41	National Public Seating	Music stand rack, holds 20 stands, dual load, DYMS20	2 each	\$264.87	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$279.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
42	Radial	Direct box, radial Pro DI, passive, green	1 each	\$92.65	\$89.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$635.38	\$90.00	\$89.00	No bid	No Bid

43	dbx	Mic Preamp, dbx 286s, channel strip	1 each	\$180.76	\$248.78	No Bid	No Bid	\$190.54	No Bid	\$189.00	No Bid	No Bid
44	Stedman	Pop filter, Steadman PS101	1 each	\$25.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$37.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
45	Shure	Dynamic studio instrument mic, Shure SM57	1 each	\$72.81	\$87.60	\$87.00	No Bid	\$73.50	\$87.60	\$75.95	No Bid	No Bid
46	Shure	Dynamic studio vocal mic, Shure SM7B	1 each	\$338.63	\$367.78	No Bid	No Bid	\$314.64	\$399.00	\$374.95	No Bid	No Bid
47	Proline	Desktop mic stand, with boom, MS112	1 each	\$18.82	No Bid	\$32.50	No Bid	\$21.38	No Bid	\$25.75	No Bid	No Bid
48	Sennheiser	Headphones, HD280 Pro	2 each	\$75.45	\$103.00	\$74.25	No Bid	\$59.95	\$75.00	\$87.75	No Bid	No Bid
49	OptiMA	White boards with staff, 9x12 inches, double-sided, 1 side with staff, 1 side blank	30 each	\$75.55, per pack of 15, item showing as unavailable, not sure when this item will be available.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
50	Dunlop	Guitar picks, yellow, Tortex, 0.73mm, 418R073, 72/pack	2 packs	\$3.32/pack of 12	\$24.78	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00	No Bid	\$20.00	No Bid	No Bid
51	Fender	Capos, phoenix, black, on-handed, all purpose, 0990413000	30 each	\$8.43	\$8.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.88	No Bid	\$9.95	\$11.27	No Bid
52	Snark	Tuners, clip-on, chromatic black, SN5	10 each	\$7.70	\$11.98	\$9.75	\$14.00	\$9.42	No Bid	\$14.50	No Bid	No Bid
53	D'Addario	Replacement guitar strings, nylon, set of 6, EJ27N	6 packs	\$12.38	\$5.00	No Bid	\$8.95	\$4.99	No Bid	\$6.50	\$5.32	No Bid
54	Fender	Guitar straps, basic black, 0990662080	8 each	\$4.38	\$4.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.25	No Bid	\$8.00	No Bid	No Bid
		Exceptions Noted:		Substitutions	None	None	None	None	Substitutions	None	Yes	
		Date PO required from District to guarantee July 5, 2021 delivery:		Will depend on stock at time of order	30-45 Days ARO	6/20/2021	3 Weeks Prior	6/5/2021	6/5/2021	Not provided	6/5/2021 for most items, see lead time info	
		Lead time if July 5, 2021 date cannot be met:		Will depend on stock at time of order, usual lead times 5-31 days ARO barring any issues with shipping from manufacturer	30-45 Days ARO	Not provided	Not provided	Lead time 10-30 days ARO	At time bid was submitted, all items are either in stock at Romeo Music or available within 30 days	30-60 days ARO	Average lead time is 5-30 days ARO, however due to manufacturer requirements, some items will take longer	
		Authorized dealer:		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	
		Are wooden instruments bid covered by at least 1 year against defects caused by change in humidity from place of origin to destination?		Depends on Manufacturers Warranties	Yes	Yes	No	Yes	N/A	Yes	Yes	
		Warranty:		Manufacturers Warranties	Varies, see response	Varies, see response	Not provided	Varies, see response	Varies, see response	Varies, see response	Varies, see response	