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Baileigh 101114 Metal Break 1 Each $5,199.00 $500.00 1-2 WEEKS NA No bid NOT APPLICABLE

Baileigh BS-300M Horizontal Band Saw 1 Each $5,649.45 $564.95
1-2 WEEKS

$5,676.00 Baileigh 07590680 $5,676.00 Only Delivery included

Baileigh BSV-12
Vertical Band Saw 
12in

1 Each $4,795.10 $479.51
1-2 WEEKS

$4,616.72 Baileigh 10754315  $4,616.72 Only Delivery included
8/30/2022

Baileigh DBG-106 Belt/Disc Finisher 1 Each $1,877.84 $187.79
1-2 WEEKS

$1,859.00 Baileigh 47872254 $1,859.00 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Baileigh IGBB-436 Metal Grinder 8in 1 Each $990.62 $99.06
1-2 WEEKS

$939.00 Baileigh 17655614 $939.00 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Baileigh PL-1236E-DRO Metal Lathe 2 Each $8,775.38 $877.54
1-2 WEEKS

$8,945.65 Baileigh 39616115 $8,945.65 Only Delivery included
8/30/2022

Baileigh PL-1340E Lathe 0 Each $10,983.20 $1,098.32
1-2 WEEKS

$11,059.00 Baileigh 10754166 $44,236.00 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

GMC 1440BGF-1 $11,079.50 Included
4-6 Weeks

Baileigh SF-5216E Foot Shear 52in 1 Each $4,099.18 $409.92
1-2 WEEKS

$3,808.98 Baileigh 92426949 $3,808.98 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Baileigh VMD-931G Mill Drill 2 Each $5,388.46 $538.85
1-2 WEEKS

$5,470.35 Baileigh 90464009 $10,940.70 Only Delivery included
5/1/2022

Delta 31-483 Spindle Sander 1 Each $755.25 $75.53
1-2 WEEKS

$606.37 Delta 61901096 $606.37 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Dewalt DW788 Scroll Saw 3 Each $726.75 $72.68
1-2 WEEKS

$698.70 Dewalt 80494131 $2,096.10 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Dewalt DW872 Cold Saw 14in 1 Each $796.10 $79.61
1-2 WEEKS

$764.73 Dewalt 09778093 $764.73 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Global Industrial 800459 Steel Utility Cart 3 Each $469.84 $46.98
5-6 WEEKS

NQ No bid Only Delivery included

Grizzly T30860 Roll Bender 1 Each $805.84 $80.58
1-2 WEEKS

NQ No bid Only Delivery included

Justrite 
35178

Welding Gas Tank 
Storage

1 Each $2,338.25 $233.84
3-4 WEEKS

NQ No bid Only Delivery included

Learniture
LNT-GNO3042-
PKAS-SO

Bin Cart 5 Each NO BID NQ No bid Only Delivery included

Lincoln Electric K2473-2
Power Mig 180c Mig 
Welder

8 Each $899.75 $89.98
2-3 WEEKS

$1,764.59 Lincoln Electric 78589256 $14,116.72 Only Delivery included
4 weeks

Lincoln Electric K2605-1
Invertec V155-S Stick 
Welder

3 Each $1,838.83 $183.38
2-3 WEEKS

$1,486.46 Lincoln Electric 56905599 $4,459.38 Only Delivery included
4 weeks

Lincoln Electric K5126
Square Wave Tig 200 
Tig Welder

2 Each $2,845.65 $284.56
2-3 WEEKS

$2,399.00 Lincoln Electric 20168274 $4,798.00 Only Delivery included
4 weeks

Powermatic 511 Panel Saw 1 Each $9,031.70 $903.17
3-4 WEEKS

$8,599.99 Powermatic 87449211 $8,599.99 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Powermatic 1791307 Jointer 1 Each $9,286.90 $923.69
2-3 WEEKS

$8,799.99 Powermatic 81332447 $8,799.99 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Powermatic 1791500 Small Band Saw 1 Each $4,042.25 $404.23
1-2 WEEKS

$3,799.99 Powermatic 76298702 $3,799.99 Only Delivery included
in-stock 2 weeks

Powermatic 1791800B Large Band Saw 1 Each $7,127.85 $712.79
1-2 WEEKS

$6,699.99 Powermatic 35293679 $6,699.99 Only Delivery included
7/30/2022

Powermatic 31A Belt/Disc Sander 2 Each $2,313.25 $231.33
1-2 WEEKS

$2,099.00 Powermatic 09183476 $4,198.00 Only Delivery included
5/20/2022

Powermatic PM2700 Shaper/Router Table 1 Each $5,212.65 $521.27
10-12 WEEKS

$4,599.99 Powermatic 81238040 $4,599.99 Only Delivery included
7/30/2022

Powermatic PM2800B Large Drill Press 2 Each $2,424.40 $242.44
1-2 WEEKS

$2,113.32 Powermatic 92206994 $4,226.64 Only Delivery included
4 weeks

Powerway ZH-02
Enclosed Material 
Crib - 22' X 4'

4 Each NO BID NQ No bid Only Delivery included

Rikon 25-905
Vertical Band Saw 
Foot Trolley

1 Each $84.00 $8.40
2-3 WEEKS

NQ No bid Only Delivery included

Sawstop 15HH-15S Planer 1 Each $4,787.05 POWERMATIC 15HH-15S
[MFG #15HH-15S: 
BID AS SPECIFIED]

$478.71
3-4 WEEKS

$4,499.99 Powermatic 72526007 $4,499.99 Only Delivery included
4 weeks

Sawstop PCS31230-
TGP252

Table Saw 2 Each $3,714.00 $371.40
1-2 WEEKS

$3,714.00 Sawstop 26149849 $7,428.00 Only Delivery included
5/30/2022

Skelang SKE20190709 Metal Break Casters 1 4 piece set NO BID NQ No bid Only Delivery included

Torchmate 4400 Plasma Cutter 1 Each NO BID $26,999.00 Torchmate 13092390 $26,999.00 Only Delivery included
4 weeks

Woodward-Fab HK-12 Track Torch 1 Each NO BID NQ No bid Only Delivery included
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*NOTE:  DEDUCT AN ADDITIONAL 5% IF ORDER IS OVER $100,000.00
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