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Hurdles AAE XLAH-HS 240 $0.00 Gill GA402 $172.98 5-12 days 
Aro

NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID GILL 42023-PS $117.99 21 $0.00 Gatetube color, 
custom decals

Gill Athletics 4060CXX $221.33 16 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Starting Gun Alfa 2183 .32 Caliber 4 $0.00 Gill GA42610 $125.36
5-12 days 

Aro NO BID $0.00 $219.00 $876.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 42610 $132.00 2 weeks $277.00 $1,108.00
Available at 

once

polymer 
orange grip, 6 

shot

Batons Athletic 
Specialties

E113254 16 $0.00
green, 

red,blue,gold,silver,b
lack , purple

Port@pit AALBAT-- $1.19 5-10 days 
Aro

$0.00 CHAMPION RB-(color) $2.18 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

$4.00 $64.00 5-7 DAYS NATIONA
L SPORTS

42011-PS $2.60 30 $0.00 Color choice Gill Athletics 430 $28.00 2 weeks $0.00

aluminum,red,g
old,green,silver
,blue,black,pur

ple

Gill 43101-43109 $3.67 Available at 
once

Cross Over Zone 
Track Protector

Beacon Athletics 3G Crossover 4 $0.00

15'W x 50"L/ Black
with gold or white 
edging* no custom 

colors

Bsn 1248319 $922.58 10-12 days NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID No Bid $0.00 Vinyl color Sportsfield 
Specialties

TCM1540 $1,192.00 6 weeks $507.78 $2,031.12 7weeks
Quoting Gill 

#493667, 7.5' 
X 30'

Gill 493668, 7.5' 
X 40'

$604.02 7 weeks

Lap Counter With 
Bell Blazer AFLCBXXX 2 $402.98 $805.96 5-10 days NO BID $0.00 $435.00 $870.00 5-7 DAYS 

STACKHO
USE 42223-PS $378.31 21 $0.00 Gill Athletics 79300 $642.67 2 weeks $427.00 $854.00

2 week 
delivery

aluminum, on 
wheels, has #s 

0-9

Measuring Cane Blazer E75069 12 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $24.00 $288.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 970 $42.67 2 weeks $21.00 $252.00 Available at 
once

Cones For Long And
Triple ?

BSN MSCONE 8 $1.98 $15.84 2-5 days aro $0.00 CHAMPION C6OR $2.05 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 975 $5.00 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Cross Over Zone 
Track Protector

BSN Cross-Over Zone Protector 4 $922.58 $3,690.32 10-12 days aro NO BID $0.00 $1,060.00 $4,240.00 10-14 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Vinyl color Sportsfield 
Specialties

TCM1540 $1,192.00 6 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Elastic Crossbar BSN AFRO50BM 4 $11.06 $44.24 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 $20.00 $80.00 5-7 DAYS CORNERS
TONE

42073-PS $14.76 20 $27.05 $108.20 6 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Football Chain And 
Down Marker

BSN 1375487 1 $302.44 $302.44 5-10 days aro GILMAN 
GEAR

PRO3+FLIP1 $910.00 2-3 DAYS $481.00 $481.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID No Bid $504.20 $504.20 6 weeks $448.00 $448.00 End Oct 
available

chevron 
pattern, 

orange/black/g
old

Football Chain Clip 
Yard Marker

BSN 1388017 1 $5.02 $5.02 5-10 days aro GILMAN 
GEAR

CLIP $35.00 2-3 DAYS $6.99 $6.99 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID No Bid $7.72 $7.72 6 weeks $8.50 $8.50 Available at 
once

14"L, orange, 
marks yds 

from 0-50 in 5 
yd increments

Football Chain Gang 
Vests

BSN 1370746 1 $0.00 Yellow /Black BSN 1370749 $18.44 2-10 days 
aro

GILMAN 
GEAR

DV3-SET3 $105.00 2-3 DAYS $31.99 $31.99 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID No Bid $47.99 $47.99 6 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Football Down 
Marker

BSN 1451723 2 $924.84 $1,849.68 5-10 days aro $966.00 $1,932.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID No Bid $1,088.25 $2,176.50 6 weeks $781.00 $1,562.00 End Oct 
available

electronic, 13" 
#s, water 
resistant, 
padded

Football End Zone 
Marker

BSN 1453456 24 $161.08 $3,865.92 5-10 days aro GILMAN 
GEAR

WP1 $36.00 2-3 DAYS $154.50 $3,708.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID No Bid $0.00 Sportsfield 
Specialties

FEZP4 (4pk) $45.00 1 week $167.00 $4,008.00 Nov. available

Anchor 
weighted, 

Price is for 
sets of 6 

Football Sideline 
Markers BSN 1249347 1 $146.78 $146.78 5-10 days aro

GILMAN 
GEAR SM11 $545.00 3-5 DAYS $257.00 $257.00

21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O. NO BID NO BID No Bid $0.00

Sportsfield 
Specialties FSYM11 $999.00 1 week $265.00 $265.00 Nov. available

15"H X 15"W, 
13" #s, choice 

orange or 
yellow w black

#s

Hurdles -Cart BSN GA4630 2 $159.98 $319.96 5-10 days aro $332.00 $664.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

$398.00 $796.00 5-7 DAYS GILL 42118-PS $373.22 21 $0.00 Powder coat 
color

Sportsfield 
Specialties

HLCRT41 $440.00 6 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Lacrosse Goals BSN LACOFFGL 2 $642.16 $1,284.32 5-10 days aro GILMAN 
GEAR

LGS1-
PR/LN1-PR

$1,650.00 7-10 DAYS $726.00 $1,452.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID CHAMPIO
N

15920-PS $86.99 21 $0.00 Addt'l LCGWK 
Mobility Kit

Sportsfield 
Specialties

LCG $1,210.00 6 weeks $689.00 $1,378.00 Nov available

Official size, 6 
mm nets, 

meets NCAA 
specs

Measuring Wheel BSN 1378131 4 $84.43 $337.72 5-10 days aro $97.00 $388.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID KOMELON 54012-PS $48.69 27 $93.40 $373.60 6 weeks $82.29 $329.16 Nov available

Pit Rake BSN 1196245 8 $36.44 $291.52 5-10 days aro $66.00 $528.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

$58.00 $464.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 451 $85.33 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Pole Vault Box 
Collar

BSN 1388862 2 $324.83 $649.66 5-10 days aro $424.00 $848.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID GILL 42186-PS $527.21 21 $0.00 Sportsfield 
Specialties

PVPBSC $611.00 3 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Starting Block Bsn ASB3000 16 $72.44 $1,159.04 5-10 days aro $112.00 $1,792.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID CHEETAH 42230-PS $153.85 21 $0.00 Colors: Red, 
Blue, Black

Gill Athletics 412 $105.00 4 weeks $112.00 $1,792.00 Available at 
once

Starting Blocks -Cart BSN 20010511 2 $256.48 $512.96 5-10 days aro $303.00 $606.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

NO BID NO BID No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 923 $255.00 4 weeks $378.00 $756.00 Nov available

Training Room 
Treatment Table BSN 1453885 1 $564.72 $564.72 5-10 days aro $665.00 $665.00

21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O. NO BID NO BID No Bid $749.99 $749.99 6 weeks $640.00 $640.00

Available at 
once

Portable, 
73"Lx28"Wx24

32"H, 600 lb 
weight 

capacity

Henry Schein

1430140 table
model 

78"Lx30'Dx3
1"H

$1,483.75
Available at 

once

Weight Scale - Pole 
Vault

BSN 1375488 2 $41.59 $83.18 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID No Bid $56.99 $113.98 6 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

100' Measuring Tape Champion Sports E45356 6 $5.97 $35.82 5-10 days aro $7.50 $45.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

CHAMPION 
#R100

NO BID NO BID CHAMPIO
N

42050-PS $10.43 30 $0.00 Gill Athletics 985 $16.00 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

200' Measuring Tape Champion Sports E45356 2 $11.06 $22.12 5-10 days aro $12.50 $25.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

CHAMPION 
#R200

NO BID NO BID CHAMPIO
N

42052-PS $15.65 30 $0.00 Gill Athletics 986 $30.67 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

50' Measuring Tape Champion Sports E45342 4 $4.12 $16.48 5-10 days aro $4.80 $19.20 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

CHAMPION 
#F50

NO BID NO BID No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 984 $12.00 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Starting Gun Everything Track 
And Field

6643 .32 Caliber 4 $0.00 Gill GA42610 $125.36 5-10 days 
Aro

NO BID $0.00 $85.00 $340.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 42610 $132.00 2 weeks $79.00 $316.00 Available at 
once

Aluminum Platform 
High Jump

Gill Fam-Aluminum Platforms 2 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $4,165.00 $8,330.00 10-14 DAYS

THIS IS FOR 
S4 HJ PIT- IF 
OTHER SIZE 
IS NEEDED 

PLEASE 
REACH OUT 

No Bid NO BID #VALUE! $3,442.00 $6,884.00 4-5 weeks

Quote is for 
the S4 

platform, part 
#733642

Gill G1 platform 
#733646

$3,634.00 4-5 weeks

Aluminum Platform 
Pole Vault

Gill Fam-Aluminum Platforms 2 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $8,875.00 $17,750.00 10-14 DAYS 

THIS IS FOR 
S4 PV PIT- IF 
OTHER SIZE 
IS NEEDED 

PLEASE 
REACH OUT 

No Bid NO BID #VALUE! $7,069.00 $14,138.00 4-5 weeks part # 733663

Breakline Cones Gill E41158 - 4in 20 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $6.00 $120.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $5.00 $100.00 2 weeks $4.98 $99.60 Available at 
once

4" orange

Elastic Krossband Gill 528 4 $21.53 $86.12 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 $20.00 $80.00 5-7 DAYS CORNERS
TONE

42073-PS $14.76 20 $22.67 $90.68 2 weeks $10.70 $42.80

High Jump Kit Gill
Fam-S4 High Jump Value 
Pack -Or- Fam-G1 High 

Jump Value Pack  
2 $8,392.92 $16,785.84 10-15 daysa aro

GAVP64217CXXY
Y NO BID $0.00 $8,895.00 $17,790.00 6-8 WEEKS

QUOTED THE 
S4 PACK 
VP64217

No Bid $0.00

Mesh/vinyl 
colors, custom 
graphics, addt'l 

DuraZone 
upgrade option 

[eliminates need 
for platform]

Sportsfield 
Specialties HJHSVP $9,425.00 16 weeks $7,819.00 $15,638.00 8 weeks

Quote is for 
the S4 HJ 

Value Pack  
#VP64217-

need pad color 

Gill
G1 HJ Value 

Pack 
#VP64617

$9,157.00 8 weeks

Hip Stickers Gill E42640
This Is 100 

Per Number 
(#s 1-25)

$0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PRICING WAS 
COMING OUT 
WRONG ON 
THE EXCEL 
FOR 100 OF 
EACH # UP 
TO 30 THE 

TOTAL PRICE 
IS $74

No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 922 (25ct) $40.00 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Pit Garages Gill Fam-Pit Garages 4 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $22,595.00 $90,380.00 APPROX 14-
21 DAYS

PER 
ADDENDUM 

ONLY 2 
GARAGES 

WERE 
NEEDED FOR 
POLE VAULT- 

SIZE WAS 
NOT 

SPECIFIED SO 
THIS GARAGE 
WILL FIT PITS 

22' X 32' OR 
SMALLER- 
INSTALL IS 

NOT 
INCLUDED - 

IT WOULD BE 
AN 

ADDITIONAL 
$5,200 FOR 

INSTALL PER 
UNIT

No Bid $20,193.33 $80,773.32 16 weeks $9,936.00 $39,744.00 8 weeks

Quote is for 
the HJ Pit 

Garage   
#881018

Gill
PV Pit 
Garage 

#883022
$17,095.00 8 weeks

Pit Rake Gill GA451 8 $81.76 $654.08 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 $58.00 $464.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $85.33 $682.64 2 weeks $88.40 $707.20 End Oct 
available

Pit Stop Gill Fam-Pit Stop 4 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

NOT NEEDED 
PER 

ADDENDUM 
IF NEEDED 

PLEASE 
REACH OUT 

NOT NEEDED 
PER 

ADDENDUM 
IF NEEDED 

PLEASE 
REACH OUT 

No Bid NO BID #VALUE! $513.00 $2,052.00 4 weeks
Quote is for 
HJ Pit Stop 

#2535
Gill PV Pit Stop 

#2534
$869.00 4 weeks

Pole Vault Cross 
Bar Placer 

Gill GA950 4 $124.13 $496.52 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 $137.00 $548.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $130.67 $522.68 2 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Pole Vault Kit Gill
Fam-S4 Pole Vault Value 

Pack 2 $23,295.74 $46,591.48 10-15 daysa aro GAVP65817C0202 NO BID $0.00 $25,595.00 $51,190.00 6-8 WEEKS No Bid $0.00

Mesh/vinyl 
colors, custom 
graphics, addt'l 

DuraZone 
upgrade option 

[eliminates need 
for platform]

Sportsfield 
Specialties PVNCAAVP $28,505.00 16 weeks $22,990.00 $45,980.00 8 weeks

Part 
#VP65817 Royal Blue bottom, gray top

Polymer Platform 
High Jump

Gill Fam-Polymer Platforms 2 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $2,375.00 $4,750.00 10-14 DAYS

THIS IS FOR 
S4 HJ PIT- IF 
OTHER SIZE 
IS NEEDED 

PLEASE 
REACH OUT 

No Bid NO BID #VALUE! $2,178.00 $4,356.00 4-5 weeks Part #734642

Polymer Platform 
Pole Vault

Gill Fam-Polymer Platforms 2 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $6,250.00 $12,500.00 10-14 DAYS

THIS IS FOR 
S4 PV PIT- IF 
OTHER SIZE 
IS NEEDED 

PLESE REACH 
OUT 

No Bid NO BID #VALUE! $5,220.00 $10,440.00 4-5 weeks Part #734663

Sand Pit Shovel Gill GA450 8 $45.93 $367.44 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 $60.00 $480.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $48.00 $384.00 2 weeks $73.90 $591.20 5 weeks

Wind Gauge Gill E42874 6 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics E39815 $344.00 2 weeks $485.00 $2,910.00 end Nov Correct Part # 
E49872

Field Hockey Goals Jaypro FHG-2GALPKG 2 $0.00 Kwikgoal 1382855 $4,173.16 5-10 days 
Aro

$3,195.00 $6,390.00 12 WEEKS 
A.R.O.

$3,850.00 $7,700.00 12 weeks No Bid $0.00 Sportsfield 
Specialties

FHG / 
FHGWK

$2305.00 / 
$410.00

6 weeks $0.00

Soccer Corner Kick 
Flags 

Kwikgoal 1379304 8 $0.00 Kwikgoal 1379302 105.49st 2-10 days 
aro

GILMAN 
GEAR

WSF-EA $90.00 7-10 DAYS $229.00 $1,832.00 21-30 DAYS 
A.R.O.

KWIK GOAL 
#6B1404

NO BID NO BID NATIONA
L SPORTS

50017-PS $40.01 30 $220.00 $1,760.00 1 week $113.70 $909.60 Available at 
once

Pole Vault Crossbars Port A Pit AFPV1503 (3pk) 2 $193.84 $387.68 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID No Bid $164.65 $329.30 6 weeks $0.00 Gill 526 $165.00 pkof 
3

Available at 
once

High Jump 
Crossbars

Port A Pit AFHJ1503 (3pk) 2 $150.22 $300.44 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID No Bid $146.92 $293.84 6 weeks $0.00 UCS 132 $165.00 pk of 
3

Available at 
once

Squeegee Rol Dri MTRDMSTR 2 $52.32 $104.64 5-10 days aro NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID No Bid $75.39 $150.78 6 weeks No Bid #VALUE!

Goal Post Pads Sportsfield 
Specialties

GPPRDG (With logo) 4 $0.00 BSN
G808YV6X
DS/G000YX

XXDS
$452.06 5-12 days 

Aro
GILMAN 

GEAR
GPP18-PRNT $1,150.00 7-10 DAYS NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID No Bid $572.00 $2,288.00 6 weeks

Viny color, 
custom digital 

graphics
$694.00 $2,776.00 8 weeks

6'H, 5'5"thick, 
need color and 

graphics in 
vector format

Female Shot/Discus 
Pack Stackhouse TTP-G 2 $0.00 Port@pit

1101454,110
1393, 

GA312, 
ARSHOT4K

, 
AFSHOT4K, 

(2) 
ASDCXXX

X

129.71st
5-10 days 

Aro NO BID $0.00 $205.00 $410.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics
816 / 3394 / 

34944
$78.67 / $24.00 

/ $46.67 2 weeks $180.00 $360.00
Available at 

once

Hurdles Stackhouse TEHS 240 $0.00 Port@pit GAAADVA $162.72
5-10 days 

Aro NO BID $0.00 $179.95 $43,188.00

4-6 WEEKS/ 
HURDLES 
MUST BE 
ORDERED 
AT SAME 

TIME AND 
SHIPPED TO 

SAME 
LOCATION

No Bid $0.00
Gatetube color, 
custom decals Gill Athletics 4060CXX $221.33 16 weeks $149.00 $35,760.00 6-8 weeks

Need gate 
tube color

Implement Scale Stackhouse TDIS 2 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $130.00 $260.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 93015 $405.33 2 weeks $99.40 $198.80 Available at 
once

Male Shot/Discus 
Pack Stackhouse TTP-B 2 $0.00 Port@pit

1101447,110
1386,GA309,
ARSHOT12,
AFSHOT12, 

(2) 
ASDCXXX

X

158.20st
5-10 days 

Aro NO BID $0.00 $215.00 $430.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics
815 / 3312 / 

34122
$88.00 / $28.00 

/ $53.33 2 weeks $189.00 $378.00
Available at 

once

Officials Flags Stackhouse TOFWR 8 $0.00 Bsn/Gill GA730270 $12.76
5-10 days 

aro NO BID $0.00 $12.00 $96.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 730270 $13.33 2 weeks $16.60 $132.80
Available at 

once

Specify 
white/red, or 
white/yellow

Pv Standard Sign Stackhouse TEPI-4 2 $0.00 Bsn/Gill GA79100 $788.63 5-10 days 
aro

NO BID $0.00 $635.00 $1,270.00 5-7 DAYS No Bid $0.00 Gill Athletics 79100 $816.00 2 weeks $418.00 $836.00 Available at 
once

*See 
Exceptions
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