
Jakes Element Skips Workspace Masters JayDee

Carpeting $133,351.21 $169,707.81 $141,202.73 No Bid $162,155.77 No Bid

Alternate 1 $28,043.64 No Bid $36,618.76 No Bid $55,484.14 No Bid

Alternate 2 No Bid $22,644.51 $499.00 No Bid $41,721.03 $31,374.00

Alternate 3 $1,840.43 $2,403.98 $2,688.36 No Bid $2,147.62 No Bid

Moving Services $26,000.60 No Bid $26,087.88 $20,400.00 $27,606.22 No Bid

*Alt 2 = Demo only

*Optional Library carts $7,260.00 $1,500.00

22-701-005 - Bid Tabulation


