
Vendor Equipment Manufacturer Part Number Warranty Lead Time ARO Price
Lift Solutions Lift 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lift Solutions Lift 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lift Solutions Electric Forklift Hyundai 15BT-9U 3YRS/4K HRS 1 WEEEK $31,872.00
Lift Solutions Propane Forklift Hyundai 25HC-9A? 3YRS/4K HRS 8 WEEKS $29,571.00
Lift Solutions Scissor Lift No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vendor Equipment Manufacturer Part Number Warranty Lead Time ARO Price

All Around Access
Lift 1 Platform Basket 27.14

1YR PL/ 3 
STRUCTURAL

Q4 2022/ Q1 2023 $175,199.00

All Around Access
Lift 2 Platform Basket 33.15

1YR PL/ 3 
STRUCTURAL

Q4 2022/ Q1 2023 $218,299.00

All Around Access Electric Forklift Big Joe LXE37-189 6 MONTHS 45-60 DAYS $40,949.00
All Around Access Propane Forklift No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
All Around Access Scissor Lift Sky Jack SJ4732 2 YRS Q4 2022/ Q1 2023 $22,899.00

Vendor Equipment Manufacturer Part Number Warranty Lead Time ARO Price
FMH Lift 1 All Access Equip CMC 83HD+ See Notes 23-25 weeks $170,850.00 *See Exceptions
FMH Lift 2 All Access Equip CMC 105HD+ See Notes TBD $242,500.00 *See Exceptions
FMH Electric Forklift CAT 2ET4000 See Notes 7-10 Days $39,950.00 *See Exceptions
FMH Propane Forklift CAT 2C3500 See Notes 7-10 Days $34,965.66 *See Exceptions
FMH Scissor Lift Snorkel S4740E See Notes 6-8 Weeks $35,750.00 *See Exceptions

Vendor Equipment Manufacturer Part Number Warranty Lead Time ARO Price

Welch Equip,ent
Lift 1 JLG X770AJ

1 Yr FULL/ 5 
MAJOR

16 WEEKS $199,971.47 *See Exceptions

Welch Equip,ent
Lift 2 JLG X1000AJ

1 Yr FULL/ 5 
MAJOR

16 WEEKS $338,951.64 *See Exceptions

Welch Equip,ent Electric Forklift Toyota 8FBE18U 5 YR 16 WEEKS $39,082.00 *See Exceptions
Welch Equip,ent Propane Forklift No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid *See Exceptions

Welch Equip,ent
Scissor Lift JLG ES3246

1 Yr FULL/ 5 
MAJOR

57 WEEKS $24,422.70 *See Exceptions
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